



**COMMISSIONERS COURT
COMMUNICATION**

COURT ORDER NUMBER	144968
PAGE 1 OF	43
DATE:	4/2/2025

**SUBJECT: BID NO. F2025086 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS
OFFICE FURNITURE - COUNTYWIDE - VARIOUS VENDORS - PER UNIT
PRICE AND DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE**

COMMISSIONERS COURT ACTION REQUESTED

It is requested that the Commissioners Court award Bid No. F2025086, Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture, Countywide, to the following vendors at the per unit price and discount from list price:

Primary	Texas Furniture Source	2 of 9 Sections
	Interior Resource Group	2 of 9 Sections
	Plano Office Supply	1 of 9 Sections
	Vari Sales Corporation	1 of 9 Sections
	Wilson Bauhaus Interiors	1 of 9 Sections
	Today's Business Solutions	1 of 9 Sections
	OCOP Express	1 of 9 Sections
Secondary	Wilson Bauhaus Interiors	2 of 9 Sections
	Plano Office Supply	2 of 9 Sections
	OCOP Express	2 of 9 Sections
	Interior Resource Group	1 of 9 Sections
	Today's Business Solutions	1 of 9 Sections
Alternate	Wilson Bauhaus Interiors	2 of 9 Sections
	Staples Contract	2 of 9 Sections
	Blue Box	2 of 9 Sections
	Plano Office Supply	1 of 9 Sections
	Martin's Office Supply	1 of 9 Sections

BACKGROUND

Notice of the County's intent to bid was advertised in local newspapers, as required by State statute, and posted on the Internet, the Arlington Black Chamber of Commerce, the Fort Worth Hispanic Chamber of Commerce, the Fort Worth Metropolitan Black Chamber of Commerce, and the Tarrant County Asian American Chamber of Commerce. Two hundred seventy-one (271) vendors were contacted and requested to participate in this bid process. All documents pertaining to this bid were posted on the Tarrant County website and were downloaded by interested bidders. A pre-bid conference held on February 12, 2025, was attended by three (3) vendors as well as representatives from Purchasing. Fourteen (14) bids and three (3) no-bids were received.

SUBMITTED BY	Purchasing	PREPARED BY:	Amos Jones Jr.
		APPROVED BY:	Christopher Lax, CPSM, CPSD, CPCP



COMMISSIONERS COURT COMMUNICATION

REFERENCE NUMBER: 144968 DATE: 4/2/2025 PAGE 2 OF 43

Bids were evaluated by Purchasing representatives. Award recommendations are to the low bids meeting specifications.

OFP Business Solutions withdrew its bid because it could not hold the price submitted.

There is no secondary or alternate award for Section 9 because only one (1) bid was received.

Tie bids were received for items in Section 4. The award recommendations were determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order No. 60616, Procedure for Awarding Tie Bids.

The term of the contract is twelve (12) months, effective April 4, 2025, with two (2) option for renewal periods of twelve (12) months each.

The purpose of this contract is to purchase miscellaneous office furniture. Furniture purchased under this agreement is typically for replacing existing furniture and small projects.

Therefore, it is the recommendation of Purchasing that Bid No. F2025086, Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture, be awarded to the vendors listed above at the per unit price and discount from list price.

FISCAL IMPACT

Expenses for last year were approximately \$230,683.65. Orders are placed on an as-needed basis. Funding is available in account 45100-2025 Non-Debt Capital/Various Cost Centers/545051 Non-tracked Equipment.

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

					Vari Sales Corporation Coppell, TX HUB - No		Panther Ergonomics Fort Worth, TX HUB - No		Interior Resource Group Dallas, TX HUB - No	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM		Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Section 1 -Allsteel									
1.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number DWW-MHWNO	45	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
1.2	Acuity Work, AdjArm,MeshBck, Graph-Graph w/Dusk Mesh -- model Number AWMGGDNO	15	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
1.3	Park Lo Lounge - Grade 1 -- model number NALS	15	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
1.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Section Total					No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Texas Furniture Source Plano, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		PLANO OFFICE SUPPLY Plano, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Blue Box LLC McKinney, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Section 1 -Allsteel					Primary Award			
1.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number DWW-MHWNO	45	EA	No Bid		\$638.79	\$28,745.55	No Bid	
1.2	Acuity Work, AdjArm, MeshBck, Graph-Graph w/Dusk Mesh -- model Number AWMGGDNO	15	EA	No Bid		\$1,034.48	\$15,517.20	No Bid	
1.3	Park Lo Lounge - Grade 1 -- model number NALS	15	EA	No Bid		\$1,632.53	\$24,487.95	No Bid	
1.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		62.6%		No Bid	
	Section Total			No Bid		\$68,750.70		No Bid	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	OCOP Express Dallas, TX HUB - No		Martin's Office Supply, Inc. Granbury, TX HUB - Yes		Todays Business Solutions Houston, TX HUB - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Section 1 -Allsteel								
1.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number DWW-MHWNO	45	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
1.2	Acuity Work, AdjArm, MeshBck, Graph-Graph w/Dusk Mesh -- model Number AWMGGDNO	15	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
1.3	Park Lo Lounge - Grade 1 -- model number NALS	15	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
1.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Section Total				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Wilson Bauhaus Interiors Dallas, TX HUB - Yes Coop - Yes		Staples Contract LLC Farmingham, MA HUB - No Coop - Yes		ODP Busines Solutions Boca Raton, FL HUB - No	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Section 1 -Allsteel			Secondary Award		Alternate Award			
1.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number DWW-MHWNO	45	EA	\$716.89	\$32,260.05	\$1,076.04	\$48,421.80	No Bid	
1.2	Acuity Work, AdjArm,MeshBck, Graph-Graph w/Dusk Mesh -- model Number AWMGGDNO	15	EA	\$1,185.19	\$17,777.85	\$1,742.58	\$26,138.70	No Bid	
1.3	Park Lo Lounge - Grade 1 -- model number NALS	15	EA	\$1,687.21	\$25,308.15	\$2,124.99	\$31,874.85	No Bid	
1.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			58.0%		38.0%		No Bid	
Section Total				\$75,346.05		\$106,435.35		No Bid	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

				Texas Furniture Source Plano, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		PLANO OFFICE SUPPLY Plano, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Blue Box LLC McKinney, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
2	Section 2 - HON			Primary Award		Secondary Award			
2.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number HNR1	105	EA	\$324.55	\$34,077.75	\$385.47	\$40,474.35	\$516.78	\$54,261.90
2.2	Desk, wood - model number H10573	35	EA	\$568.85	\$19,909.75	\$564.29	\$19,750.15	\$821.34	\$28,746.90
2.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number H105535	70	EA	\$400.55	\$28,038.50	\$397.34	\$27,813.80	\$578.34	\$40,483.80
2.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number HNR6	70	EA	\$239.85	\$16,789.50	\$243.38	\$17,036.60	\$336.42	\$23,549.40
2.5	Vertical file cabinet, 4 Drawer -- model number H514	20	EA	\$347.10	\$6,942.00	\$352.82	\$7,056.40	\$418.44	\$8,368.80
2.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			61.1%		62.9%		56.0%	
Section Total				\$105,757.50		\$112,131.30		\$155,410.80	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

				OCOP Express Dallas, TX HUB - No		Martin's Office Supply, Inc. Granbury, TX HUB - Yes		Todays Business Solutions Houston, TX HUB - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
2	Section 2 - HON								
2.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number HNR1	105	EA	\$428.24	\$44,965.20	\$456.92	\$47,976.60	\$487.00	\$51,135.00
2.2	Desk, wood - model number H10573	35	EA	\$710.31	\$24,860.85	\$735.31	\$25,735.85	\$791.00	\$27,685.00
2.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number H105535	70	EA	\$500.16	\$35,011.20	\$515.16	\$36,061.20	\$557.00	\$38,990.00
2.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number HNR6	70	EA	\$290.94	\$20,365.80	\$316.35	\$22,144.50	\$342.00	\$23,940.00
2.5	Vertical file cabinet, 4 Drawer - model number H514	20	EA	\$424.15	\$8,483.00	\$434.15	\$8,683.00	\$495.00	\$9,900.00
2.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			53.3%		0.0%		48.0%	
Section Total				\$133,686.05		\$140,601.15		\$151,650.00	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Wilson Bauhaus Interiors Dallas, TX HUB - Yes Coop - Yes		Staples Contract LLC Farmingham, MA HUB - No		ODP Business Solutions Boca Raton, FL HUB - No	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
2	Section 2 - HON			Alternate Award					
2.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number HNR1	105	EA	\$410.10	\$43,060.50	\$613.80	\$64,449.00	\$389.47	\$40,894.35
2.2	Desk, wood - model number H10573	35	EA	\$721.15	\$25,240.25	\$943.02	\$33,005.70	\$572.91	\$20,051.85
2.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number H105535	70	EA	\$475.35	\$33,274.50	\$664.02	\$46,481.40	\$403.41	\$28,238.70
2.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number HNR6	70	EA	\$288.49	\$20,194.30	\$406.72	\$28,470.40	\$247.09	\$17,296.30
2.5	Vertical file cabinet, 4 Drawer -- model number H514	20	EA	\$398.55	\$7,971.00	\$589.62	\$11,792.40	\$358.21	\$7,164.20
2.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			59.6%		38.0%		51.0%	
	Section Total			\$129,740.55		\$184,198.90		\$113,645.40	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

					Vari Sales Corporation Coppell, TX HUB - No		Panther Ergonomics Fort Worth, TX HUB - No		Interior Resource Group Dallas, TX HUB - No	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM		Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
3	Section 3 - Global									
3.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number 6321	15	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
3.2	Desk, wood -- model number Z3072F3L	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
3.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number ZHBC72	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
3.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number 6324	5	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
3.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number 25-401	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
3.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Section Total					No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Texas Furniture Source Plano, TX HUB - No		PLANO OFFICE SUPPLY Plano, TX HUB - No		Blue Box LLC McKinney, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
3	Section 3 - Global							Alternate Award	
3.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number 6321	15	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$489.02	\$7,335.30
3.2	Desk, wood -- model number Z3072F3L	2	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$912.87	\$1,825.74
3.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number ZHBC72	2	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$563.50	\$1,127.00
3.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number 6324	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$306.74	\$1,533.70
3.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number 25-401	2	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$290.57	\$581.14
3.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		No Bid		51.0%	
Section Total				No Bid		No Bid		\$12,402.88	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

				OCOP Express Dallas, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Martin's Office Supply, Inc. Granbury, TX HUB - Yes		Todays Business Solutions Houston, TX HUB - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
3	Section 3 - Global			Secondary Award					
3.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number 6321	15	EA	\$409.17	\$6,137.55	\$499.02	\$7,485.30	\$471.00	\$7,065.00
3.2	Desk, wood -- model number Z3072F3L	2	EA	\$890.51	\$1,781.02	\$937.87	\$1,875.74	\$1,025.00	\$2,050.00
3.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number ZHBC72	2	EA	\$549.70	\$1,099.40	\$573.50	\$1,147.00	\$633.00	\$1,266.00
3.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number 6324	5	EA	\$335.56	\$1,677.80	\$316.74	\$1,583.70	\$369.00	\$1,845.00
3.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer-model number 25-401	2	EA	\$283.45	\$566.90	\$290.57	\$581.14	\$327.00	\$654.00
3.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			52.2%		45.0%		45.0%	
Section Total				\$11,262.67		\$12,672.88		\$12,880.00	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Wilson Bauhaus Interiors Dallas, TX HUB - Yes Coop - Yes		Staples Contract LLC Farmingham, MA HUB - No Coop - Yes		ODP Business Solutions Boca Raton, FL HUB - No Coop - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
3	Section 3 - Global			Primary Award					
3.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number 6321	15	EA	\$420.79	\$6,311.85	\$643.56	\$9,653.40	\$467.10	\$7,006.50
3.2	Desk, wood -- model number Z3072F3L	2	EA	\$848.43	\$1,696.86	\$1,188.54	\$2,377.08	\$881.55	\$1,763.10
3.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number ZHBC72	2	EA	\$500.19	\$1,000.38	\$713.00	\$1,426.00	\$517.50	\$1,035.00
3.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number 6324	5	EA	\$272.44	\$1,362.20	\$388.12	\$1,940.60	\$281.70	\$1,408.50
3.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number 25-401	2	EA	\$289.41	\$578.82	\$367.66	\$735.32	\$266.85	\$533.70
3.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			57.0%		38.0%		54.0%	
Section Total				\$10,950.11		\$16,132.40		\$11,746.80	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Vari Sales Corporation Coppell, TX HUB - No		Panther Ergonomics Fort Worth, TX HUB - No		Interior Resource Group Dallas, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
4	Section 4 - Humanscale							Secondary Award	
4.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number F114GCF45XFSHNSC	35	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$837.30	\$29,305.50
4.2	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number L213BN10CF10XFSHNSC	3	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$752.42	\$2,257.26
4.3	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number L406BM10CF10NC	3	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$412.48	\$1,237.44
4.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		No Bid		52.0%	
Section Total				No Bid		No Bid		\$32,800.20	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

				Texas Furniture Source Plano, TX HUB - No		PLANO OFFICE SUPPLY Plano, TX HUB - No		Blue Box LLC McKinney, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
4	Section 4 - Humanscale							Alternate Award	
4.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number F114GCF45XFSHNSC	35	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$838.35	\$29,342.25
4.2	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number L213BN10CF10XFSHNSC	3	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$751.50	\$2,254.50
4.3	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number L406BM10CF10NC	3	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$403.65	\$1,210.95
4.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		No Bid		55.0%	
Section Total				No Bid		No Bid		\$32,807.70	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	OCOP Express Dallas, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Martin's Office Supply, Inc. Granbury, TX HUB - Yes Coop - Yes		Todays Business Solutions Houston, TX HUB - Yes Coop - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
4	Section 4 - Humanscale			Primary Award					
4.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number F114GCF45XFSHNSC	35	EA	\$819.72	\$28,690.20	No Bid		\$838.35	\$29,342.25
4.2	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number L213BN10CF10XFSHNSC	3	EA	\$394.68	\$1,184.04	No Bid		\$751.50	\$2,254.50
4.3	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number L406BM10CF10NC	3	EA	\$734.80	\$2,204.40	No Bid		\$403.65	\$1,210.95
4.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			56.0%		No Bid		45.0%	
Section Total				\$32,078.64		\$0.00		\$32,807.70	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

				Wilson Bauhaus Interiors Dallas, TX HUB - Yes		Staples Contract LLC Farmingham, MA HUB - No		ODP Business Solutions Boca Raton, FL HUB - No	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
4	Section 4 - Humanscale								
4.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number F114GCF45XFSHNSC	35	EA	\$843.19	\$29,511.65	\$1,109.20	\$38,822.00	\$838.35	\$29,342.25
4.2	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number L213BN10CF10XFSHNSC	3	EA	\$418.15	\$1,254.45	\$994.29	\$2,982.87	\$751.50	\$2,254.50
4.3	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number L406BM10CF10NC	3	EA	\$758.27	\$2,274.81	\$534.06	\$1,602.18	\$403.65	\$1,210.95
4.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			56.0%		38.0%		45.0%	
Section Total				\$33,040.91		\$43,407.05		\$32,807.70	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Vari Sales Corporation Coppell, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Panther Ergonomics Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Interior Resource Group Dallas, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
5	Section 5 - Kimball International							Primary Award	
5.1	Task, mid back mesh chair -- model number K56TMBUB4LSL	7	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$465.01	\$3,255.07
5.2	Desk, wood -- model number K56TMBUB4LSL53KE3672DDFBLL	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$1,337.16	\$6,685.80
5.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number 53K3040BCOSSFL	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$465.81	\$2,329.05
5.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number K58KT	10	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$723.73	\$7,237.30
5.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number 53KE2436LFFFB4	10	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$1,178.79	\$11,787.90
5.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		No Bid		57.0%	
Section Total				No Bid		No Bid		\$31,295.12	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

				Texas Furniture Source Plano, TX HUB - No		PLANO OFFICE SUPPLY Plano, TX HUB - No		Blue Box LLC McKinney, TX HUB - No	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
5	Section 5 - Kimball International								
5.1	Task, mid back mesh chair -- model number K56TMBUB4LSL	7	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
5.2	Desk, wood -- model number K56TMBUB4LSL53KE3672DDFBLL	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
5.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number 53K3040BCOSSFL	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
5.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number K58KT	10	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
5.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number 53KE2436LFFFB4	10	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
5.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Section Total				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

				OCOP Express Dallas, TX HUB - No		Martin's Office Supply, Inc. Granbury, TX HUB - Yes		Todays Business Solutions Houston, TX HUB - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
5	Section 5 - Kimball International								
5.1	Task, mid back mesh chair -- model number K56TMBUB4LSL	7	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
5.2	Desk, wood -- model number K56TMBUB4LSL53KE3672DDFBLL	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
5.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number 53K3040BCOSSFL	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
5.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number K58KT	10	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
5.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number 53KE2436LFFFB4	10	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
5.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Section Total				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Wilson Bauhaus Interiors Dallas, TX HUB - Yes Coop - Yes		Staples Contract LLC Farmingham, MA HUB - No Coop - Yes		ODP Busines Solutions Boca Raton, FL HUB - No	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
5	Section 5 - Kimball International			Secondary Award		Alternate Award			
5.1	Task, mid back mesh chair -- model number K56TMBUB4LSL	7	EA	\$512.31	\$3,586.17	\$668.98	\$4,682.86	\$455.51	\$3,188.57
5.2	Desk, wood -- model number K56TMBUB4LSL53KE3672DDFBLL	5	EA	\$1,520.25	\$7,601.25	\$1,832.72	\$9,163.60	\$1,223.85	\$6,119.25
5.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number 53K3040BCOSSFL	5	EA	\$494.11	\$2,470.55	\$617.52	\$3,087.60	\$420.66	\$2,103.30
5.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number K58KT	10	EA	\$795.23	\$7,952.30	\$1,055.86	\$10,558.60	\$719.14	\$7,191.40
5.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number 53KE2436LFFFB4	10	EA	\$1,243.98	\$12,439.80	\$1,683.92	\$16,839.20	\$1,147.18	\$11,471.80
5.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			56.0%		38.0%		56.0%	
Section Total				\$34,050.07		\$44,331.86		\$30,074.32	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Vari Sales Corporation Coppell, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Panther Ergonomics Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Interior Resource Group Dallas, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
6	Section 6 -National							Primary Award	
6.1	Task, mid back mesh chair -- model number N15TMS	16	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$638.42	\$10,214.72
6.2	Desk, wood -- model number WWN3672DDFLS	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$1,542.76	\$7,713.80
6.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number WW3640BCOFL	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$437.25	\$2,186.25
6.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number N15RR	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$438.06	\$2,190.30
6.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number WW2436LFF4LL	10	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$1,066.93	\$10,669.30
6.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		No Bid		57.0%	
	Section Total			No Bid		No Bid		\$32,974.37	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

				Texas Furniture Source Plano, TX HUB - No		PLANO OFFICE SUPPLY Plano, TX HUB - No		Blue Box LLC McKinney, TX HUB - No	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
6	Section 6 -National								
6.1	Task, mid back mesh chair -- model number N15TMS	16	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
6.2	Desk, wood -- model number WWN3672DDFLS	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
6.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number WW3640BCOFL	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
6.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number N15RR	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
6.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number WW2436LFF4LL	10	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
6.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Section Total				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

				OCOP Express Dallas, TX HUB - No		Martin's Office Supply, Inc. Granbury, TX HUB - Yes		Todays Business Solutions Houston, TX HUB - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
6	Section 6 -National								
6.1	Task, mid back mesh chair -- model number N15TMS	16	EA	No Bid		\$747.63	\$11,962.08	\$663.00	\$10,608.00
6.2	Desk, wood -- model number WWN3672DDFLS	5	EA	No Bid		\$1,737.57	\$8,687.85	\$1,867.00	\$9,335.00
6.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number WW3640BCOFL	5	EA	No Bid		\$469.93	\$2,349.65	\$411.00	\$2,055.00
6.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number N15RR	5	EA	No Bid		\$507.79	\$2,538.95	\$449.00	\$2,245.00
6.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number WW2436LFF4LL	10	EA	No Bid		\$1,228.63	\$12,286.30	\$1,083.00	\$10,830.00
6.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		47.0%		57.0%	
Section Total				No Bid		\$37,824.83		\$35,073.00	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Wilson Bauhaus Interiors Dallas, TX HUB - Yes Coop - Yes		Staples Contract LLC Farmingham, MA HUB - No Coop - Yes		ODP Business Solutions Boca Raton, FL HUB - No	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
6	Section 6 -National			Secondary Award		Alternate Award			
6.1	Task, mid back mesh chair --- model number N15TMS	16	EA	\$700.54	\$11,208.64	\$928.14	\$14,850.24	\$632.22	\$10,115.52
6.2	Desk, wood -- model number WWN3672DDFLS	5	EA	\$1,564.64	\$7,823.20	\$2,005.70	\$10,028.50	\$1,419.60	\$7,098.00
6.3	Bookcase, wood -- model number WW3640BCOFL	5	EA	\$462.87	\$2,314.35	\$592.10	\$2,960.50	\$372.45	\$1,862.25
6.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number N15RR	5	EA	\$482.83	\$2,414.15	\$628.68	\$3,143.40	\$428.04	\$2,140.20
6.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer --- model number WW2436LFF4LL	10	EA	\$1,162.14	\$11,621.40	\$1,562.40	\$15,624.00	\$982.80	\$9,828.00
6.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			56.0%		38.0%		56.0%	
Section Total				\$35,381.74		\$46,606.64		\$31,043.97	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Vari Sales Corporation Coppell, TX HUB - No		Panther Ergonomics Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Interior Resource Group Dallas, TX HUB - No	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
7	Section 7 - Ergogenesis/Bodybuilt					Secondary Award			
7.1	Task, high back, arms chair -- model number J2507	5	EA	No Bid		\$1,021.00	\$5,105.00	No Bid	
7.2	Executive Task, low back mesh chair -- model number J3507	3	EA	No Bid		\$1,145.16	\$3,435.48	No Bid	
7.3	Task, high back chair, 24/7 chair -- model number I2507	3	EA	No Bid		\$1,226.12	\$3,678.36	No Bid	
7.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		66.5%		No Bid	
Section Total				No Bid		\$12,218.84		No Bid	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Texas Furniture Source Plano, TX HUB - No		PLANO OFFICE SUPPLY Plano, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Blue Box LLC McKinney, TX HUB - No	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
7	Section 7 - Ergogenesis/Bodybuilt					Alternate Award			
7.1	Task, high back, arms chair -- model number J2507	5	EA	No Bid		\$798.00	\$3,990.00	No Bid	
7.2	Executive Task, low back mesh chair -- - model number J3507	3	EA	No Bid		\$1,371.76	\$4,115.28	No Bid	
7.3	Task, high back chair, 24/7 chair -- model number I2507	3	EA	No Bid		\$1,472.71	\$4,418.13	No Bid	
7.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		60.1%		No Bid	
Section Total				No Bid		\$12,523.41		No Bid	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	OCOP Express Dallas, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Martin's Office Supply, Inc. Granbury, TX HUB - Yes Coop - Yes		Todays Business Solutions Houston, TX HUB - Yes Coop - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
7	Section 7 - Ergogenesis/Bodybuilt							Primary Award	
7.1	Task, high back, arms chair -- model number J2507	5	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$976.00	\$4,880.00
7.2	Executive Task, low back mesh chair -- model number J3507	3	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$1,100.16	\$3,300.48
7.3	Task, high back chair, 24/7 chair -- model number I2507	3	EA	No Bid		No Bid		\$1,181.12	\$3,543.36
7.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		No Bid		54.5%	
Section Total				No Bid		No Bid		\$11,723.84	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

				Wilson Bauhaus Interiors Dallas, TX HUB - Yes		Staples Contract LLC Farmingham, MA HUB - No		ODP Busines Solutions Boca Raton, FL HUB - No	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
7	Section 7 - Ergogenesis/Bodybuilt								
7.1	Task, high back, arms chair -- model number J2507	5	EA	\$1,171.71	\$5,858.55	No Bid		\$1,084.44	\$5,422.20
7.2	Executive Task, low back mesh chair -- model number J3507	3	EA	\$1,317.78	\$3,953.34	No Bid		\$1,222.40	\$3,667.20
7.3	Task, high back chair, 24/7 chair -- model number I2507	3	EA	\$1,413.02	\$4,239.06	No Bid		\$1,312.36	\$3,937.08
7.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			50.0%		No Bid		50.0%	
Section Total				\$14,050.95		No Bid		\$13,026.48	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Vari Sales Corporation Coppell, TX HUB - No		Panther Ergonomics Fort Worth, TX HUB - No		Interior Resource Group Dallas, TX HUB - No	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
8	Section 8 - EUROTECH								
8.1	Task, high back, arms chair -- model number LEM4ERG	25	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
8.2	Ergohuman, high back chair -- model number LE9ERG	16	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
8.3	24/7 EUR Ececutive chair, -- model number 24/7	86	EA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
8.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Section Total			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Texas Furniture Source		PLANO OFFICE SUPPLY		Blue Box LLC	
				Plano, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit
8	Section 8 - EUROTECH								
8.1	Task, high back, arms chair -- model number LEM4ERG	25	EA		\$620.90	\$15,522.50	No Bid	No Bid	
8.2	Ergohuman, high back chair -- model number LE9ERG	16	EA		\$626.40	\$10,022.40	No Bid	No Bid	
8.3	24/7 EUR Ececutive chair, -- model number 24/7	86	EA		\$343.25	\$29,519.50	No Bid	No Bid	
8.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid					57.9%	No Bid	No Bid	
	Section Total					\$55,064.40	No Bid	No Bid	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	OCOP Express Dallas, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Martin's Office Supply, Inc. Granbury, TX HUB - Yes Coop - Yes		Todays Business Solutions Houston, TX HUB - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
8	Section 8 - EUROTECH					Secondary Award		Alternate Award	
8.1	Task, high back, arms chair -- model number LEM4ERG	25	EA	\$632.10	\$15,802.50	\$718.43	\$17,960.75	\$809.00	\$20,225.00
8.2	Ergohuman, high back chair -- model number LE9ERG	16	EA	\$638.55	\$10,216.80	\$725.66	\$11,610.56	\$817.00	\$13,072.00
8.3	24/7 EUR Esecutive chair, -- model number 24/7	86	EA	\$353.46	\$30,397.56	\$406.14	\$34,928.04	\$453.00	\$38,958.00
8.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid				57.0%		47.0%		45.0%
Section Total				\$56,416.86		\$64,499.35		\$72,255.00	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

				Wilson Bauhaus Interiors Dallas, TX HUB - Yes		Staples Contract LLC Farmingham, MA HUB - No		ODP Business Solutions Boca Raton, FL HUB - No	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
8	Section 8 - EUROTECH								
8.1	Task, high back, arms chair -- model number LEM4ERG	25	EA	\$1,352.88	\$33,822.00	No Bid		\$629.41	\$15,735.25
8.2	Ergohuman, high back chair -- model number LE9ERG	16	EA	\$694.06	\$11,104.96	No Bid		\$635.29	\$10,164.64
8.3	24/7 EUR Ececutive chair, -- model number 24/7	86	EA	\$410.29	\$35,284.94	No Bid		\$356.47	\$30,656.42
8.4	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			50.0%		No Bid		55.0%	
Section Total			\$80,211.90			No Bid		\$56,556.31	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Vari Sales Corporation Coppell, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Panther Ergonomics Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		Interior Resource Group Dallas, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
9	Section 9 - VARI			Primary Award					
9.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number 401493	2	EA	\$359.10	\$718.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9.2	Desk, metal with laminate top-- model number 402277	2	EA	\$765.00	\$1,530.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9.3	Bookcase, metal with laminate shelving -- model number 402473	2	EA	\$359.10	\$718.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number 401382	2	EA	\$382.50	\$765.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number 400742	2	EA	\$359.10	\$718.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

					Texas Furniture Source Plano, TX HUB - No		PLANO OFFICE SUPPLY Plano, TX HUB - No		Blue Box LLC McKinney, TX HUB - No	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	
9	Section 9 - VARI									
9.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number 401493	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
9.2	Desk, metal with laminate top-- model number 402277	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
9.3	Bookcase, metal with laminate shelving -- model number 402473	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
9.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number 401382	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
9.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number 400742	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	OCOP Express Dallas, TX HUB - No		Martin's Office Supply, Inc. Granbury, TX HUB - Yes		Todays Business Solutions Houston, TX HUB - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
9	Section 9 - VARI								
9.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number 401493	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
9.2	Desk, metal with laminate top-- model number 402277	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
9.3	Bookcase, metal with laminate shelving -- model number 402473	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
9.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number 401382	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
9.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number 400742	2	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

				Wilson Bauhaus Interiors Dallas, TX HUB - Yes		Staples Contract LLC Farmingham, MA HUB - No		ODP Business Solutions Boca Raton, FL HUB - No	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
9	Section 9 - VARI								
9.1	Task, low back mesh chair -- model number 401493	2	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9.2	Desk, metal with laminate top-- model number 402277	2	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9.3	Bookcase, metal with laminate shelving -- model number 402473	2	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9.4	Guest chair, leg base, grade 1 -- model number 401382	2	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9.5	Vertical file cabinet 4 drawer -- model number 400742	2	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Vari Sales Corporation Coppell, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes			Panther Ergonomics Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes			Interior Resource Group Dallas, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		
				Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended	
9.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid				10.0%			No Bid			No Bid	
Section Total					\$4,449.60			No Bid			No Bid	

Note: ODP Business Solutions withdrew their Bid because they could not hold their price.

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Texas Furniture Source Plano, TX HUB - No		PLANO OFFICE SUPPLY Plano, TX HUB - No		Blue Box LLC McKinney, TX HUB - No	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
9.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
Section Total					No Bid		No Bid		No Bid

Note: ODP Business Sollutions withdrew ther Bid because they could not hold their price.

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	OCOP Express Dallas, TX HUB - No		Martin's Office Supply, Inc. Granbury, TX HUB - Yes		Todays Business Solutions Houston, TX HUB - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
9.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
Section Total					No Bid		No Bid		No Bid

Note: ODP Business Solutions withdrew their Bid because they could not hold their price.

Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Wilson Bauhaus Interiors Dallas, TX HUB - Yes		Staples Contract LLC Farmingham, MA HUB - No		ODP Business Solutions Boca Raton, FL HUB - No	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
9.6	Discount % offered for items not listed on the Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Section Total				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

Note: ODP Business Solutions withdrew their Bid because they could not hold their price.



TAKINGS IMPACT ASSESSMENT CHECKLIST

Complete this form for any county action that involves the adoption of a regulation, policy, guideline, court resolution, or order.

Project/Regulation Name: Bid No. F2025086 - Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture - Countywide - Various Vendors - Per Unit Price and Discount from List Price

County Department: PURCHASING

Contact Person: Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.

Phone Number for Contact Person: (817) 884-3245

Type of TIA Performed: SHORT TIA or FULL TIA. Circle one after answering the questions in Sections II and III below.

I. Stated Purpose

Attach to this checklist an explanation of the purpose of the regulation, policy, guideline, court resolution, or order.

Note: The remainder of this Takings Impact Assessment Checklist should be completed in consultation with the Criminal District Attorney's Office.

II. Potential Effect on Private Real Property

1. Does the county action require a physical invasion, occupation, or dedication of real property?

Yes _____ No ✓

2. Does the county action limit or restrict a real property right, even partially, or temporarily?

Yes _____ No ✓

If you answered yes to either question, go to Section III. If you answered no to both, STOP HERE and circle SHORT TIA at the top of the form.
