COMMISSIONERS COURT COURT ORDER NUMBER 145089
COMMUNICATION PAGE 1 OF 12
DATE: 4/15/2025

SUBJECT: BID NO. F2024077 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR GROUND-BASED
MOSQUITO CONTROL AND SURVEILLANCE ACTIVITIES - PUBLIC
HEALTH - VARIOUS VENDORS - EXERCISE FIRST OPTION FOR
RENEWAL - SAME FIRM FIXED PRICES

#x%* CONSENT AGENDA ***

COMMISSIONERS COURT ACTION REQUESTED

It is requested that the Commissioners Court approve renewal of Bid No. F2024077, Annual Contract for
Ground-Based Mosquito Control and Surveillance Activities, for the first optional twelve (12) month period at
the same firm fixed prices.

BACKGROUND

On May 21, 2024, the Commissioners Court, through Court Order #143158, awarded Bid No. F2024077,
Annual Contract for Ground-Based Mosquito Control and Surveillance Activities, for Public Health, to the
following vendors:

Primary PRP Services LLC d/b/a Municipal Mosquito
Secondary Vector Disease Control International (VDCI)

The awards were based upon low bid meeting specifications and contained options to renew for two (2)
additional twelve (12) month periods.

The purpose of this contract is to allow an integrated mosquito management approach via chemical control to
reduce disease-carrying mosquitos in unincorporated areas of Tarrant County.

The vendors notified Purchasing in writing that their prices will remain firm through June 4, 2026. Public
Health notified Purchasing in writing that they are pleased with the vendors and want to renew.

Therefore, it is the joint recommendation of Public Health and Purchasing that the Commissioners Court
approve renewal of Bid No. F2024077, Annual Contract for Ground-Based Mosquito Control and Surveillance
Activities, for another twelve (12) month period.

FISCAL IMPACT

Expenses for last year were approximately $20,900.00. Funding is available in account T0400-2025 Public
Health/5100209000 Public Health/523071 Insecticides.
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February 18, 2025

Patrick Prather

President

Municipal Mosquito

705 N Bowser Rd., Suite 118
Richardson, TX 75081

Re: Bid No. F2024077 — Annual Contract for Ground-Based Mosquito Control and Surveillance
Activities

Dear Mr. Prather:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with two (2) options to renew for an additional twelve (12)
months each. The original contract was for the period of June 5, 2024 through June 4, 2025. The
effective dates for the first renewal option will run from June 5, 2025 through June 4, 2026.

Tarrant County Purchasing Department hereby extends an invitation to Municipal Mosquito to accept the
first option for an additional one (1) year period as the primary vendor for this bid as awarded on May 21,
2024. Municipal Mosquito acknowledges formal renewal of the option and any contract is contingent
upon review and approval by the Tarrant County Commissioners Court at a later date. Please mark the
appropriate response below and provide your signature above your printed name. All prices must remain
firm for the optional renewal period through June 4, 2026.

es, Municipal Mosquito will accept the offer to extend the same firm fixed prices through June 4,
2026. Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.

DNO, Municipal Mosquito will NOT accept the offer to extend the same firm fixed prices through June 4,
2026.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? Yes [:]No
If Yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please email your signed response.

Sincerely,

SO SR A S March 3, 2025
Teresa Ralls, Senior Buyer Patrick Prather, President Date
Tarrant County Municipal Mosquito

817-884-3246



Bid No. F2024077

The list of other government entities currently utilizing this contract is as follows:

Bedford, City of
Carroliton, City of
Colieyville, City of
Everman, City of
Grapevine, City of
Haltom City, City of
Haslet, Town of
Keller, City of
Southlake, City of
Watauga, City of




Chris Lax, MS.SCM, CPSM, CPSD, CPCP
Assistant Purchasing Agent

March 14, 2025

Vector Disease Control International (VDCI)
Jason Williams

1320 Brookwood Dr., Suite H

Little Rock, AR 72202

Re: Bid No. F2024077 — Annual Contract for Ground-Based Mosquito Control and Surveillance
Activities

Dear Mr. Williams:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with two (2) options to renew for an additional twelve (12)
months each. The original contract was for the period of June 5, 2024 through June 4, 2025. The
effective dates for the first renewal opticn will run from June 5, 2025 through June 4, 2026.

Tarrant County Purchasing Department hereby extends an invitation to Vector Disease Control
International (VDCI) to accept the first option for an additional one (1) year period as the secondary
vendor for this bid as awarded on May 21, 2024, VDCI! acknowledges formal renewal of the option and
any contract is contingent upon review and approval by the Tarrant County Commissioners Court at a
later date. Please mark the appropriate response below and provide your signature above your printed
name. All prices must remain firm for the optional renewal period through June 4, 2026.

es, VDCI will accept the offer to extend the same: firm fixed prices through June 4, 2026. Please
include a current 1295 Form with your response.

DNO, VDC!l will NOT accept the offer to extend the same firm fixed prices through June 4, 2026.
Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? [VIYes [INo

If Yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please email your signed response.

Sincerely,
W Jason W Digitally signed by Jason W.
Willi
Williams ’ Date: 2025.03.14 114347 05100 3/14/2025
Teresa Ralls, Senior Buyer Jason Williams Date
Tarrant County Vector Disease Control International

817-884-3246 (VDCI)



Current Entities Utilizing Bid No. F2024077— Annual Contract for Ground-Based
Mosquito Control and Surveillance Activities

Grapevine, TX
Southlake, TX
Pantego, TX

Crowley, TX



Memorandum

To:  Bethany Hambrick

Dept: Public Health

From: Teresa Ralls, Sr. Buyer, Purchasing Department
Date: March 14, 2025

Re:; Renewal of Bid No. F2024077, Annual Contract for Ground-Based
Mosquito Control and Surveillance Activities

The above referenced contract will expire on June 4, 2025. This contract
included two (2) options to renew with the vendor for additional twelve (12)
month terms. The first renewal term would commence June 5, 2025, and
would expire June 4, 2026

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the
vendors listed below for twelve more months, please check the appropriate
item and email this form back to me at tfralls@tarrantcountytx.gov by March
18, 2025:

PRP Services LLC d/b/a Municipal Mosquito
Vector Disease Control International (VDCI)

Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned
vendor for the (order) renewal term of the contract.

Funds to support this contract will be provided by the following accounts:
T0400-2025/523071/5100209000

. No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above-
mentioned vendor for the following reason(s).

Beth L H b . k Digitallysigned by Bethany L.
SIGNATURE ethany L. Hambric 3:2?2325,03.14 15:15:11 -05'00" DATE:




Bid No. F2024077 Annual Contract for Ground
Based Mosquito Control and Surveillance
Activities

PRIMARY

SECONDARY

PRP Services LLC d/b/a
Municipal Mosquito
Richardson, TX
HUB - Yes
CO-OP - Yes

Vector Disease Control
International (VDCI)
Little Rock, AR
HUB - No
CO-0OP - Yes

Note: No-bids were received from Brady Industries of Texas LLC

Price

, Unipak Corp., and Petroserv Inc.

Price




PRIMARY SECONDARY

Bid Zo” F2024077 Annual O.o::wﬂ _"oﬂ.mﬁ.ocza Based PRP Services LLC d/b/a Vector Disease Control
Mosquito Control and Surveillance Activities Municipal Mosquito International (VDCI)
Richardson, TX Little Rock, AR
HUB - Yes HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OF - Yes
Line #|Description QTY UOoM Price Price
Section 2: TRUCK-MOUNTED ULV GROUND SPRAYING:
PRIMARY AND SECONDARY RECOMMENDATION
Organophosphate Class ‘ $ 9,500.00 | § 9,916.00

Section 2. TRUCK-MOUNTED ULV GROUND SPRAYING:
PRIMARY AND SECONDARY RECOMMENDATION
Pyrethroid Class 8,900.00

* TOTAL 18,400.00 18,316.00
Note: Only the primary recommendation per the medium application rate is considered for award.

No-bids were received from Brady Industries of Texas LLC, Unipak Corp., and Petroserv Inc.

* Award determined according to in-state preference pursuant to Texas Government Code, 2252.003.




PRIMARY

Bid No. F2024077 Annual Contract for Ground Based Mosquito PRP Services LLC d/b/a Vector Disease Control
Control and Surveillance Activities Municipal Mosquito International (VDCI)
Richardson, TX Little Rock, AR
HUB - Yes HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Line #|Description QTY Uom Price Price
Section 3: ATV-MOUNTED AND BACKPACK-MOUNTED
ULV AND/OR THERMAL FOGGING: PRIMARY AND No Bid
SECONDARY RECOMMENDATION
Organophosphate Class - ATV ULV $ 3,200.00

g

Section 3. ATV-MOUNTED AND BACKPACK-MOUNTED

ULV AND/OR THERMAL FOGGING: PRIMARY AND

SECONDARY RECOMMENDATION

Organophosphate Class - ATV Thermal Fogging 4,000.00

20

Section 3: ATV-MOUNTED AND BACKPACK-MOUNTED

ULV AND/OR THERMAL FOGGING: PRIMARY AND

SECONDARY RECOMMENDATION

Organophosphate Class - Backpack ULV 3,280.00

i ; 00

Section 3: ATV-MOUNTED AND BACKPACK-MOUNTED

ULV AND/OR THERMAL FOGGING: PRIMARY AND

SECONDARY RECOMMENDATION

Organophosphate Class - Backpack Thermal Fogging 2,400.00



PRIMARY

Bid No. mmomaoﬁ.\/::cm_ On:.qmoﬁ for Ground Based Mosquito PRP Services LLC d/b/a Vector Disease Control
Control and Surveillance Activities Municipal Mosquito International (VDCI)
Richardson, TX Little Rock, AR
HUB - Yes HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Line #|Description QTY UOM Price Price
Section 3: ATV-MOUNTED AND BACKPACK-MOUNTED
ULV AND/OR THERMAL FOGGING: PRIMARY AND No Bid
SECONDARY RECOMMENDATION
Pyrethroid Class - ATV ULV $ 3,200.00

Section 3: ATV-MOUNTED AND BACKPACK-MOUNTED
ULV AND/OR THERMAL FOGGING: PRIMARY AND
SECONDARY RECOMMENDATION

B
Section 3: ATV-MOUNTED AND BACKPACK-MOUNTED
ULV AND/OR THERMAL FOGGING: PRIMARY AND
SECONDARY RECOMMENDATION

Pyrethroid Class - Backpack ULV 3,080.00

Section 3. ATV-MOUNTED AND BACKPACK-MOUNTED
ULV AND/OR THERMAL FOGGING: PRIMARY AND
SECONDARY RECOMMENDATION

Pyrethroid Class - Backpack Thermal Fogging

TOTAL :ﬁj T \ « 25,760.00
Note: Only the primary recommendation per the medium application rate is considered for award.
No-bids were received from Brady Industries of Texas LLC, Unipak Corp., and Petroserv Inc.




PRIMARY SECONDARY

Bid No. F2024077 Annual Contract for Ground Based Mosquito PRP Services LLC d/b/a Vector Disease Control
Control and Surveillance Activities Municipal Mosquito International (VDCI)
Richardson, TX Little Rock, AR
HUB - Yes HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Line #|Description QTY UoMm Price Price
Section 4. TRUCK-MOUNTED LV LARVICIDING
Application: Truck-Mounted LV Larviciding Chemical:
Vectobac WDG or equivalent $ 164,000.00 | $ 176,078.00

Section 4: TRUCK-MOUNTED LV LARVICIDING
Application: Truck-Mounted LV Larviciding Chemical: Altosid
SR-5 or equivalent.

$ 101,000.00 | $ 110,580.00

TOTAL $ ~265,000.00 | $ 286,668.00
Note: Only the price per medium application rate is considered for award. i
No-bids were received from Brady Industries of Texas LLC, Unipak Corp., and Petroserv Inc.




Bid No. F2024077 Annual Contract for Ground Based Mosquito

Control and Surveillance Activities

PRIMARY

SECONDARY

PRP Services LLC d/b/a

Vector Disease Control

d

Section 5: ATV-MOUNTED AND BACKPACK-MOUNTED LV
LARVICIDING Application: Backpack-Mounted LV Larviciding
Chemical: Vectobac WDG i .

Section 5: ATV-MOUNTED AND BACKPACK-MOUNTED LV
LARVICIDING Application: ATV-Mounted LV Larviciding
Chemical: Altosid SR-5 or equivalent.

Section 5: ATV-MOUNTED AND BACKPACK-MOUNTED LV
LARVICIDING Application: Backpack-Mounted LV
Larviciding Altosid SR-5 or equivalent.

Municipal Mosquito International (VDCI)
Richardson, TX Little Rock, AR
HUB - Yes HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Line #|Description QTY UOM Price Price

Section 5: ATV-MOUNTED AND BACKPACK-MOUNTED LV
LARVICIDING Application: ATV-Mounted LV Larviciding
Chemical: Vectobac WDG or equivalent $ 18,500.00 23,607.80

$ 8,400.00

$ 10,400.00

No Bid

17,059.00

No Bid

TOTAL $ 43,900.00 $40,666.80
Note: Only the price per medium application rate is considered for award.
No-bids were received from Brady Industries of Texas LLC, Unipak Corp., and Petroserv Inc.
PRIMARY SECONDARY
PRP Services d/b/a Vector Disease Control
Municipal Mosquito International (VDCI)
Richardson, TX Liftle Rock, AR
HUB - Yes HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Line # [Description QTyY Uom Price Price
Section 6: MOSQUITO INSPECTION AND LARVICIDING $ 145.00 140.00

TOTAL

Note: No-bids were received from Brady Industries of Texas LLC, Unipak Corp., and Petroserv Inc.
* Award determined according to in-state preference pursuant to Texas Government Code, 2252.003.



TAKINGS IMPACT ASSESSMENT CHECKLIST

Complete this form for any county action that involves the adoption of a regulation,
policy, guideline, court resolution, or order.

Project/Regulation Name:_ Bid No. F2024077 - Annual Contract for Ground-Based Mosquito
Control and Surveillance Activities - Public Health - Various Vendors - Exercise First Option for
Renewal - Same Firm Fixed Prices

County Department: PURCHASING

Contact Person: Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.

Phone Number for Contact Person: (817) 884-3245

Type of TIA Performed: (SHORT TIA or FULL TIA. Circle one after answering the questions in
Sections Il and Il below.
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l. Stated Purpose

Attach to this checklist an explanation of the purpose of the regulation, policy, guideline,
court resolution, or order.
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Note: The remainder of this Takings Impact Assessment Checklist should
be completed in consuiltation with the Criminal District Attorney’s Office.

Il Potential Effect on Private Real Property

1. Does the county action require a physical invasion, occupation, or dedication of real
property?
Yes No \/

2. Does the county action limit or restrict a real property right, even partially, or
temporarily?

Yes No v

If you answered yes to either question, go to Section IlI. If you answered no to both, STOP
HERE and circle SHORT TIA at the top of the form.
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