COMMISSIONERS COURT COURT ORDER NUMBER 145087

COMMUNICATION PAGE 1 OF 20
DATE: 4/15/2025

SUBJECT: BID NO. 2023-127 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR TIRE AND TUBE REPAIRS
OR SERVICE FOR PASSENGER VEHICLES, LIGHT-DUTY TRUCKS,
MEDIUM-DUTY TRUCKS, COMMERCIAL TRUCKS, AND HEAVY-DUTY
EQUIPMENT - COUNTYWIDE - VARIOUS VENDORS - EXERCISE
SECOND AND FINAL OPTION FOR RENEWAL - SAME FIRM FIXED
PRICES, HOURLY RATES, AND DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE

#x%* CONSENT AGENDA ***

COMMISSIONERS COURT ACTION REQUESTED

It is requested that the Commissioners approve renewal of Bid No. 2023-127, Annual Contract for Tire and
Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial
Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment, Countywide, for the second and final optional twelve (12) month period at
the same firm fixed prices, hourly rates and discount from list price to the following vendors:

Primary Cowser Tire and Service Sections 1, 2, and 4
Southern Tire Mart, LLC Section 3

Secondary Southern Tire Mart, LLC Sections 1, 2, and 4
Cowser Tire and Service Section 3

BACKGROUND

On June 20, 2023, the Commissioners Court, through Court Order #141131, awarded Bid No. 2023-127,
Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty Trucks, Medium-
Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment, Countywide, to the following vendors:

Primary Cowser Tire and Service Sections 1, 2, and 4
Southern Tire Mart, LLC Section 3

Secondary Southern Tire Mart, LLC Sections 1, 2, and 4
Cowser Tire and Service Section 3

Alternate Rick’s Tire Service, Inc. Sections 1 and 3

The awards were based upon low bid meeting specifications and contained options to renew for two (2)
additional twelve (12) month periods.

On February 6, 2024, the Commissioners Court, through Court Order #142589, approved the first renewal
option.

SUBMITTED BY | Purchasing PREPARED BY: | Julie Nichols

APPROVED BY: | Christopher Lax, CPSM, CPSD, CPCP
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The purpose of this bid is to provide tire and tube repair service on an as-needed basis throughout the year.

Rick’s Tire Service, Inc. did not respond to the renewal request. The remaining vendors notified Purchasing in
writing that their prices will remain firm through June 28, 2026. Transportation Services and the four (4)
Maintenance Precincts notified Purchasing in writing that they are pleased with the remaining vendors and want
to renew.

Therefore, it is the joint recommendation of Fleet Services, the four (4) Maintenance Precincts, and Purchasing
that the Commissioners Court approve renewal of Bid No. 2023-127, Annual Contract for Tire and Tube
Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and
Heavy-Duty Equipment, for another twelve (12) month period.

FISCAL IMPACT

Expenses for last year were approximately $37,121.02. Funding is available in the following accounts and
will be used on an as needed basis:

10000-2025 General Fund/6840200000 Fleet Services/576171 Vehicle Maintenance

26100-2025 Road and Bridge Fund/6110300000 Precinct 1 Maintenance/558025 Tires and Tubes
26100-2025 Road and Bridge Fund/6210300000 Precinct 2 Maintenance/558025 Tires and Tubes
26100-2025 Road and Bridge Fund/6310300000 Precinct 3 Maintenance/558025 Tires and Tubes
26100-2025 Road and Bridge Fund/6410300000 Precinct 4 Maintenance/558025 Tires and Tubes




N TARRANT COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
, 100 E. Weatherford St. #303 * Fort Worth, TX 76196 * (817) 884-1414 * (817) 8842629 (Fax)

Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P. Chris Lax, CPSM, CPSD, CPCP
Purchasmg Agent Assistant Purchasing Agent
November 11, 2024 )

Cowser Tire and Service

Vendor # 7011733

Contact; Kevin Davis

Phone Number: 817-625-8473
Additional Phone Number: 817-247-9970
E-mail: kdavis@cowsertire.com

1700 NE Loop 820

Fort Worth, TX. 76106

Re: BID NO. 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles,
Light-Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with two (2) options to renew for additional twelve (12) months
each. The original contract was for the period of June 29, 2023 through June 28, 2024. The first renewal
option took place from June 29, 2024 through June 28, 2025, The effective dates for the final renewal
y/wlll be from June 29, 2025 through June 28, 2026.

Yes, Cowser Tire and Service will accept the offer to extend the same firm fixed prices, hourly rate,
and discount from list price through the final renewal period.
Please include a current 1295 Form with vour response,

[0 No, Cowser Tire and Service will NOT accept the offer to extend the same firm fixed prices, hourly
rate, and discount from list price through the final renewal period. ‘

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? 0 Yes [1 No
If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter. /

‘Please fax or email your signed response,

Sincerely,

Tole. Nidhels XD
Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer Name: W Evin ‘DA\IIS
(P) 817.884.1133 Kevin Davis
(F) 817.884.1133 (P) &\ ézﬁ 8‘4“"15
(E) jmnichols@tarrantcountytx.gov (F) 5 36

(E) Kda s @ lezi{,ftwfe., &
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o 4 Purchasing Agent Assistant Purchasing Agent

*i»ww¢

%
bl o

November 8, 2024

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Vendor # 7002486

Contact: Richard Conwill

Phone Number: 877-786-4681

24/7 Call Center Phone Number: 1-877-786-8473

Additional Contact for Emergencies: James Allen at 817-332-9000
E-mail: gov-sales@stmtires.com

Re: BID NO. 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles,
Light-Diuty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment

Dear SiriWadany:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with two (2) options to renew for additional twelve (12) months
each. The original contract was for the period of June 29, 2023 through June 28, 2024, The first renewal
option took place from June 29, 2024 through June 28, 2025, The effective dates for the final renewal
option will be from June 28, 2025 through June 28, 20286.

¥ Yes, Southern Tire Mart, LLC will accept the offer to extend the same firm fixed prices, hourly rate,
ami dmmuni fwm lint price through thes.- ﬁnm mnﬁwa! mrmd
pase incly t 1285 Form with v OB,

I Ne, Southern Tire Mart, LLC will NOT accept the offer to extend the same firm fixed prices, hourly
rate, and discount from list price through the final renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? 11 Yes @ No
if yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincersly,

e e f\g\ }iwi‘”{wi 5 ‘
pIa A

Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer Name; Richard Conwill
(P) 817.684.1133 Richard Conwill, James Allen, or Jeremy Bufler
{F} B17.884.1133 k) B 3?%‘?%«%@%@

{E) jmnichols@tarrantcountyts.gov

(E) ﬁwwm@mmtmﬁmm




Memorandum

To: Keith Harris

Dept.: Fleet Services

From: Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer, Purchasing Department

Date:  March 26, 2025

Re: BID 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger
Venhicles, Light-Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-
Duty Equipment

The above referenced contract will expire on 06/28/2025. This contract included options to
renew with the vendor for two (2) additional twelve (12) month terms. The original agreement
was from June 29, 2023 through June 28, 2024. The first renewal term commenced June 29,
2024 through June 28, 2025. The final renewal term will commence June 28, 2025 through
June 28, 2026.

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the vendor(s) listed
below for twelve (12) more months, please check the appropriate boxes and email this form
back to me on or before Friday, January 10, 2025,

Primary Cowser Tire and Service Sections 1, 2, and 4
Southern Tire Mart, LLC Section 3

Secondary Southern Tire Mart, LL.C Sections 1, 2, and 4
Cowser Tire and Service Section 3

@/Mizemate Rick’s Tire Service, Inc. Sections T and 3
Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned vendor(s) for
the final renewal term of the contract. Account information must be provided below.

111600 / 10000-2025 / 6840200000 / NRG

(GL acct) { _(Fund #) / _(Cost Center) /_(Grant# or NRG) _

D No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned
vendor(s) for the following reason(s).

7 = - m
SIGNATURE: /M 5{ Ko _ ope 326~ 23




Memorandum

To: Brian Davis, Rick Hatcher, or Jasmine Corrales

Dept.:  Precinct 1 Maintenance

From: Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer, Purchasing Department

Date:  November 11, 2024

Re: BID 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger
Vehicles, Light-Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-
Duty Equipment

The above referenced contract will expire on 06/28/2025. This contract included options to
renew with the vendor for two (2) additional twelve (12) month terms. The original agreement
was from June 29, 2023 through June 28, 2024. The first renewal term commenced June 28,
2024 through June 28, 2025. The final renewal term will commence June 28, 2025 through
June 28, 2026.

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the vendor(s) listed
below for twelve (12) more months, please check the appropriate boxes and email this form

back to me on or before Friday, November 15, 2024,

Primary Cowser Tire and Service Sections 1, 2, and 4
Southern Tire Mart, LL.C Section 3

Secondary Southern Tire Mart, LLC Sections 1, 2, and 4
Cowser Tire and Service Section 3

Alternate Rick’s Tire Service, Inc. Sections 1 and 3

W Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned vendor(s) for
the final renewal term of the contract. Account information must be provided below.

GER02S 1 20100-2025/ WII0A 00000 NRG

(GL acct) ! (Fund#  /_(CostCenter) /_(Grant# or NRG) _

E} No, 1 do not wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned
vendor(s) for the following reason(s).

DATE: _LI[N|202¢]

SIGNATURE: _ 2




Memorandum

To:
Dept.:
From:
Date:
Re:

Jason Murphy, Jason Thomas, or Ron Edwards

Precinct 2 Maintenance

Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer, Purchasing Department

November 8, 2024

BID 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger
Vehicles, Light-Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-
Duty Equipment

The above referenced contract will expire on 06/28/2025. This contract included options to
renew with the vendor for two (2) additional twelve (12) month terms. The original agreement
was from June 28, 2023 through June 28, 2024. The first renewal term commenced June 29,
2024 through June 28, 2025. The final renewal term will commence June 29, 2025 through
June 28, 2026.

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the vendor(s) listed
below for twelve (12) more months, please check the appropriate boxes and email this form
back to me on or before Friday, November 15, 2024.

Primary Cowser Tire and Service Sections 1, 2, and 4
Southern Tire Mart, LLC Section 3

Secondary Southern Tire Mart, LLC Sections 1, 2, and 4
Cowser Tire and Service Section 3

Alternate Rick’s Tire Service, Inc. Sections 1 and 3

Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned vendor(s) for
the final renewal term of the contract. Account information must be provided below.

SEQOLE [ 26]00-2025 42103 100000

(GL acct) /| _(Fund#) { _(Cost Center) /_(Grant# or NRG)

No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned
vendor(s) for the following reason(s).

SIGNATURE: Cl)u@ e Y oria ATE: 11/8/2024



Memorandum

To: Anthony Jaramillo, John Stubbiefield, Amanda Key, Edward Haidusek, or Mayo
Sanchez Perez Jr

Dept.: Precinct 3 Maintenance

From: Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer, Purchasing Department

Date: November 8, 2024

Re: BID 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger
Vehicles, Light-Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-
Duty Equipment

- The above referenced contract will expire on 06/28/2025. This contract included options to
renew with the vendor for two (2) additional twelve (12) month terms. The original agreement
was from June 29, 2023 through June 28, 2024. The first renewal term commenced June 29,
2024 through June 28, 2025. The final renewal term will commence June 29, 2025 through
June 28, 2026.

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the vendor(s) listed
below for twelve (12) more months, please check the appropriate boxes and email this form
back to me on or before Friday, November 15, 2024.

Primary Cowser Tire and Service Sections 1, 2, and 4
Southern Tire Mart, LLC Section 3
Secondary Southern Tire Mart, LLC Sections 1, 2, and 4
Cowser Tire and Service Section 3
E/T/SZItemate Rick’s Tire Service, Inc. Sections 1 and 3
Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned vendor(s) for
the final renewal term of the contract. Account information must be provided below.

SEXVHS | DL00-20F L2 0200000

(GL. acct) [ _(Fund #) / _(Cost Center) / (Grant# or NRG)

D No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned
vendor(s) for the following reason(s).

SIGNATURE: 4747/& j)ﬁmcéf(\l DATE: _{ ((/ 8’/ AL‘/



Memorandum

To: Ned Pyle

Dept: Precinct 4 Maintenance

From: Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer, Purchasing Departrent

Date: November 11,2024

Re: BID 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger
Vehicles, Light-Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-
Duty Equipment

The above referenced contract will expire on 06/28/2025. This contract included options fo
renew with the vendor for two (2) additional twelve (12) month terms. The original agreement
was from June 29, 2023 through June 28, 2024. The first renewal term commenced June 29,
2024 through June 28, 2025. The final renewal term will commence June 29, 2025 through
June 28, 2026,

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the vendor(s) listed
below for twelve (12) more months, please check the appropriate boxes and email this form
back to me on or before Friday, November 15, 2024.

Primary Cowser Tire and Service Sections 1, 2, and 4
Southern Tire Mart, LLC Section 3

Secondary Southern Tire Mart, LLC Sections 1, 2, and 4
Cowser Tire and Service Section 3

Alternate Rick’s Tire Service, Inc. Sections 1 and 3

H/ Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned vendor(s) for
the final renewal term of the contract. Account information must be provided below.

BIOLS LR (MI3IReD /

b

{GL acet) ! _{Fund #) /_(Cost Center) /_(Grant# or NRG) _

D No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned
vendor(s) for the following reason(s).

SIGNATURE: /Y\&%QL pate:_ tl-11-24



RFB 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty

Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment

Cowser Tire and Service

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Rick's Tire Service,Inc.

Fort Worth, TX. Columbia, MS Arlington, TX.
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
item Description Qty| Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price | Ext Price
Section 1: On Site Tire and Tube Repairs
or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light- .
Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, and Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award
Commercial Trucks
Tire Repair Passenger Vehicle
1 & Light Truck, Sizes 14 Inch 35/ ¢$ 2500| % 87500| 8% 2500|3$ 875.00({% 25001 % 875.00
Through 22 Inch
Mount/Dismount of Passenger
2 }Vehicle & Light Truck, Sizes 14|170] $ 20.00 | $ 3,400.00 | § 2500| % 4,25000|% 25.00{ $ 4,250.00
inch Through 22 Inch
Tire Repair Commercial
3 [Vehicle & Medium Truck, Sizes | 35| $ 30.00|$ 1,05000| 3% 2500 % 875001 % 2500|$% 875.00
19.5 Inch Through 24.5 Inch
Mount/Dismount of Commercial
4 |Vehicle & Medium Truck, Sizes [170] $ 25.00 | $ 4,250.00| % 25001 8% 4,25000{$% 2500} $ 4,250.00
19.5 Inch Through 24.5 Inch




RFB 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty

Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment

Cowser Tire and Service

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Rick's Tire Service,Inc.

Vendor Recognized Holidays

Fort Worth, TX. Columbia, MS Arlington, TX.
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
ltem Description Qty; Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price | Ext Price
Section 1: On Site Tire and Tube Repairs
or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light- .
Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, and Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award
Commercial Trucks
5 NMMMM Call per visit per 55| % 45.00|$ 2,475.00|$ 6500| 8% 357500|$ 75.00|$ 4,125.00
Section 1 Total $ 12,050.00 | § 13,825.00 | $ 14,375.00
Discount percentage off for Products and o o o
Services not Listed in this Section 0% 0% 0%
Fee for Service Call After Hours wmm.oc per hour $175.00 per hour $100.00 per hour
Fee for Service Call on Weekends or $127.50 per hour $175.00 per hour $100.00 per hour




RFB 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty

Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment

Cowser Tire and Service

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Rick's Tire Service,inc.

Fort Worth, TX. Columbia, MS Arlington, TX.
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
ltem Description Qty] Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
Section 2: On Site Tire and Tube Repairs .
or Service for Heavy-Duty Equipment Primary Award Secondary Award
1 |Tire Repair of Heavy 11$% 2500 ¢ 2500 % 25001 $ 25.00 |No Bid No Bid
Equipment, Sizes up to 17 Inch
2 iMount/Dismount of Heavy 11$ 2500 % 25001 % 2500} % 25.00 [No Bid No Bid
Equipment, Sizes up to 17 inch
Tire Repair of Heavy
3 |Equipment, Sizes 18 Inch 101% 75.00| $ 750003 75003 750.00 {No Bid No Bid
Through 33 Inch
Mount/Dismount of Heavy
4 {Equipment, Sizes 18 inch 10($ 7500 $ 75000, % 7500 $ 750.00 |No Bid No Bid
Through 33 Inch
Tire Repair of Heavy
5 |Equipment, Sizes 34 Inch 11% 85.00| % 85.00| 8§ 8500 8 85.00 |No Bid No Bid
Through 48 Inch
Mount/Dismount of Heavy
6 |Equipment, Sizes 34 inch 1]1$% 8500 $ 8500 % 85001 8 85.00 {No Bid No Bid
Through 48 Inch




RFB 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty

Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment

Cowser Tire and Service

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Rick's Tire Service,inc.

Fort Worth, TX. Columbia, MS Arlington, TX.
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
CO-0OP - Yes CC-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
ltem Description Qty! Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price | Ext Price
Section 2: On Site Tire and Tube Repairs .
or Service for Heavy-Duty Equipment Primary Award Secondary Award
7 |Service Call per visit per 10|$ 45.00|$ 45000 % 12500 $ 1,250.00 |No Bid No Bid
location
Section 2 Total $ 2,170.00 2,970.00* {No Bid
Discount percentage off for Products and o o .
Services not Listed in this Section 0% 0% |No Bid
Does Vendor Have a Boom Truck? Yes Yes No Bid
Does Vendor Have a Truck Crane? Yes Yes No Bid
Does Vendor Have a Tire Manipulator? Yes Yes No Bid
Fee for Service Call After Hours $85.00 per hour $175.00 per hour No Bid
Fee for Service Call on Weekends or $127.50 per hour $175.00 per hour No Bid

Vendor Recognized Holidays




RFB 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty

Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment

Cowser Tire and Service

Southern Tire Mari, LLC

Rick's Tire Service,Inc.

Fort Worth, TX. Columbia, MS Arlington, TX.
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
liem Description Qty| Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price | Ext Price
Section 3: In-Store Tire and Tube Repairs
or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light- .
Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, and Secondary Award Primary Award Alternate Award
Commercial Trucks
Tire Repair Passenger Vehicle
1 |& Light Truck, Sizes 14 Inch $ 2000 % 60001 % 15.00] % 4500 3% 25001 % 75.00
Through 22 Inch
Mount/Dismount of Passenger
2 |Vehicle & Light Truck Tires, $ 2000| 8 60.001$ 15.00 $ 4500 | $ 2500 % 75.00
Sizes 14 Inch Through 22 Inch
Tire Balance for 14 Inch
3 Through 22 Inch $ 1195, % 11951 % 15.00 | $ 15.00 | § 25001} % 25.00
Tire Repair Commercial
4 |Vehicle & Medium Truck, Sizes $ 250018 75001 % 22001 % 66.00| 3% 2500(9% 75.00
19.5 inch Through 24.5 Inch




RFB 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty

Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment

Cowser Tire and Service

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Rick's Tire Service,Inc.

Fort Worth, TX. Columbia, MS Arlington, TX.
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
CO-OF - Yes CO-0OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
ltem Description Qty{ Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
Section 3. In-Store Tire and Tube Repairs
or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light- .
Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, and Secondary Award Primary Award Alternate Award
Commercial Trucks
Mount/Dismount of Commercial
5 |Vehicle & Medium Truck, Sizes| 3 | $§ 25001 $ 75001 % 2200 $ 66.00 % 2500 $ 75.00
19.5 Inch Through 24.5 Inch
Tire Baiance for Sizes 19.5 /
6 Inch Through 24.5 inch 118 25008 2500({ % 2500 % 2500 |% 2500} $ 25.00
Section 3 Total $ 306951 $ 262001} % 350.00
Discount percentage off for Products and o o o
Services not Listed in this Section 0% 0% 0%
Hours of In-Store Operation 7:00 AM-5:00 PM 7:30 AM-5:00 PM 8:00 AM-5:00 PM

Days of In-Store Operation

Monday-Friday with 7:30
AM-12:00 PM Saturday

Monday-Friday

Monday-Friday




RFB 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty
Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment

Cowser Tire and Service Southern Tire Mart, LLC Rick's Tire Service,Inc.

Fort Worth, TX. Columbia, MS Arlington, TX.
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
itemn Description Qty| Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

Section 3. In-Store Tire and Tube Repairs

or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light- .
Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, and Secondary Award Primary Award Alternate Award

Commercial Trucks

Address of Service Location 1700 NE Loop 820 in Fort {3100 North Freeway in {3004 E. Abram Street in

Worth, TX 76106 Fort Worth, TX. 76111  |Adington, TX. 76010
Section 4: In-Store Tire and Tube Repairs .
or Service for Heavy-Duty Equipment Primary Award Seconaaty Award
1 |Tire Repair for Heavy 119% 2500 % 25001 % 2500 % 25.00 | No Bid No Bid
Equipment, Sizes up to 17 Inch
2 |Mount/Dismount for Heavy 11% 25.00| % 25001 % 2500 % 25.00 | No Bid No Bid
Equipment, Sizes up to 17 Inch
3 |Tire Balanceforupto17inch | 1 |$ 1195 $ 11951 % 1500} % 15.00 | No Bid No Bid




RFB 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty
Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment

Cowser Tire and Service Southern Tire Mart, LLC Rick's Tire Service,Inc.

Fort Worth, TX. Columbia, MS Arlington, TX.
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
item Description Qty! Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
Section 4: In-Store Tire and Tube Repairs Primary Award Secondary Award

or Service for Heavy-Duty Equipment

Tire Repair for Heavy
4 |Equipment, Sizes 18 Inch 11% 7500} % 7500 | &§ 6500} % 65.00 | No Bid No Bid
Through 33 Inch

Mount/Dismount for Heavy
5 Equipment, Sizes 18 Inch 1 $ 7500 % 75001 % 60,00 % 60.00 | No Bid No Bid
Through 33 Inch

Tire Balance for Sizes 18 Inch

6 Through 33 Inch 11% 1195(% 11958 3000|$ 30.00 | No Bid No Bid

Tire Repair for Heavy
7 |Equipment, Sizes 34 Inch 11$%$ 8500 9% 85.00 § 8500} % 85.00 | No Bid No Bid
Through 48 Inch

Mount/Dismount for Heavy . .

Through 48 Inch




RFB 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty

Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment

Cowser Tire and Service

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Rick's Tire Service,inc.

Fort Worth, TX. Columbia, MS Arlington, TX.
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
ltem Description Qty{ Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price | Ext Price
Section 4; In-Store Tire and Tube Repairs .
or Service for Heavy-Duty Equipment Primary Award Secondary Award
Tire Balance for 34 inch . .
g Through 48 Inch 11$ 31001 % 3100 | $ 6000} $ 60.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 4 Total $ 42490 | ¢ 450.00 {No Bid
Discount percentage off for Products and o o .
Services not Listed in this Section 0% 0% No Bid
Does Vendor Have a Boom Truck? Yes Yes No Bid
Does Vendor Have a Truck Crane? Yes Yes No Bid
Does Vendor Have a Tire Manipulator? Yes Yes No Bid
Hours of In-Store Operation 7:00 AM-5:00 PM 7:30 AM-5:00 PM No Bid
Monday-Friday with .
Days of In-Store Operation 7:30 AM-12:00 PM Monday-Friday and 1/2 No Bid

Saturday

Day on Saturday




RFB 2023-127 Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty
Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks, and Heavy-Duty Equipment

Cowser Tire and Service |. Southern Tire Mart, LLC Rick's Tire Service,inc.

Fort Worth, TX. Columbia, MS Arlington, TX.
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
CO-0OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes

CO-OP - Yes

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

Qty! Unit Price Ext Price

tem Description

Section 4. In-Store Tire and Tube Repairs .
or Service for Heavy-Duty Equipment Primary Award Secondary Award

. . 1700 NE Loop 820 in | 71833 Mony Street in Fort .
Address of Service Location Fort Worth, TX. 76106 |Worth, TX. 76102 . |No Bid

Notes: Response from LT Gibson dba Ace Tire deemed non-responsive for failing to sign the Compliance From as required. The
Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company withdrew their response. No alternate awards for Sections 2 and 4 due to only two BIDS received

for these sections.



eeeiieet TAKINGS IMPACT ASSESSMENT CHECKLIST

Complete this form for any county action that involves the adoption of a regulation,
policy, guideline, court resolution, or order.

Project/Regulation Name:__Bid No. 2023-127 - Annual Contract for Tire and Tube Repairs or
Service for Passenger Vehicles, Light-Duty Trucks, Medium-Duty Trucks, Commercial Trucks,
and Heavy-Duty Equipment - Countywide - Various Vendors - Exercise First Option for Renewal
- Same Firm Fixed Prices, Hourly Rates, and Discount from List Price

County Department: PURCHASING

Contact Person: Melissa Lee, C.P.M., AP.P.

Phone Number for Contact Person: {817) 884-3245

Type of TIA Performed: (SHORT TIA or FULL TIA. Circle one after answering the questions in
Sections Il and Il below
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. Stated Purpose

Attach to this checklist an explanation of the purpose of the regulation, policy, guideline,
court resolution, or order.
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Note: The remainder of this Takings Impact Assessment Checklist should
be completed in consultation with the Criminal District Attorney’s Office.

. Potential Effect on Private Real Property

1. Does the county action require a physical invasion, occupation, or dedication of real
property?
Yes No \

2. Does the county action limit or restrict a real property right, even partially, or
temporarily?

Yes No v

If you answered yes to either question, go to Section . If you answered no to both, STOP
HERE and circle SHORT TIA at the top of the form.
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