COMMISSIONERS COURT COURT ORDER NUMBER 145756
COMMUNICATION PAGE 1 OF 20
DATE: 8/19/2025

SUBJECT: BID NO. F2025202 - PURCHASE OF TECHNOLOGY REFRESH PROJECT
- COMMUNITY SUPERVISION AND CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT -
VARIOUS VENDORS - PER UNIT PRICE

COMMISSIONERS COURT ACTION REQUESTED

It is requested that the Commissioners Court award Bid No. F2025202, Purchase of Technology Refresh
Project, for Community Supervision and Corrections Department (CSCD), to the following vendors at the per
unit price:

CDW Government LLC 5 of 10 Items

Aztek Computers LLC 2 of 10 Items

Brightcentra, Inc. 1 of 10 Items

Hypertech USA, Inc. 1 of 10 Items

Smart Group Systems 1 of 10 Items
BACKGROUND

Notice of the County’s intent to bid was advertised in a local newspaper, as required by State statute, and posted
on the Internet, the Arlington Black Chamber of Commerce, the Fort Worth Hispanic Chamber of Commerce,
the Fort Worth Metropolitan Black Chamber of Commerce, and the Tarrant County Asian American Chamber
of Commerce. Seven hundred eleven (711) vendors were contacted and requested to participate in this bid
process. All documents pertaining to this bid were posted on the Tarrant County website and were downloaded
by interested bidders. Thirty-two (32) bids and nine (9) no-bids were received.

Bids were evaluated by CSCD and Purchasing representatives. Award recommendations are to the low bids
meeting specifications.

Items 2 and 3 and Items 8 and 9 have been awarded as combined totals to ensure the same vendor supplies both
hardware and warranty for continuity of support.

The purpose of this purchase is for technology refresh for CSCD meeting rooms, training rooms, and CSCD
administration. This project includes the purchase of laptops, scanners, monitors, interactive displays, and
various accessories.

Therefore, it is the joint recommendation of CSCD and Purchasing that Bid No. F2025202, Purchase of
Technology Refresh Project, be awarded to the vendors listed above at the per unit price.

SUBMITTED BY | Purchasing PREPARED BY: | Kehinde Olugbile

APPROVED BY: | Christopher Lax, CPSM, CPSD, CPCP
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FISCAL IMPACT

Funding in the amount of $667,910.62 is available in account GCJAD-2004/C0010-2025 Basic
Supervision/2510100000.




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

Alpha Tango, LLC Adorama Inc.
Temple, TX New York, NY
HUB - Yes HUB - No
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking . .
! station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB-C 9 $227.25 $2,045.25 No Bid No Bid
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,399.57 $21,596.13 No Bid No Bid
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $227.44 $2,046.96 No Bid No Bid
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $23,643.09 No Bid
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer, . .
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $211.99 $1,907.91 No Bid No Bid
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 - . .
5 | 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte | ° | N° B No Bid $2596.00 | $23,364.00
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with . .
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 No Bid No Bid $1,241.00 $11,169.00
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document 9 No Bid No Bid $130.00 $1,170.00
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Notebook - WUXGA
9 HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support - 310 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Year - Warranty
Total for Lines 8 & 9 No Bid No Bid
10 Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

Trafera, LL.C

Government Goods, Inc.

St. Paul, MN Brooklyn, NY
HUB - No HUB - No
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking
1 station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB.C 9 $225.00 $2,025.00 $219.00 $1,971.00
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,333.00 $20,997.00 $2,118.45 $19,066.05
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $225.00 $2,025.00 $219.05 $1,971.45
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $23,022.00 $21,037.50
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer,
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $210.00 $1,890.00 $206.17 $1,855.53
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 - . .
® | 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte | ° | $4619.00 | $41,571.00 No Bid No Bid
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
6 Microsoft Teams Rooms with | o | ¢4 58309 |  §14,247.00 No Bid No Bid
Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 No Bid No Bid $1,500.45 $465,139.50
Notebook - WUXGA
g [P CarePack Premium Onsite Support 4 |\ gig No Bid $156.85 $48,623.50
4 Year - Warranty
Total for Lines 8 & 9 No Bid $513,763.00
1o | Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch | 54 | g448 00 |  $134,400.00 No Bid No Bid
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

Riverside Technologies, Inc. CDW Government LLC
North Sioux City, SD Vernon Hills, IL
HUB - No HUB - No
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking . .
! station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB-C ° No Bid No Bid $392.00 $3,528.00
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 No Bid No Bid $2,260.00 $20,340.00
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 No Bid No Bid $220.00 $1,980.00
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 No Bid $22,320.00
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer, . .
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage o No Bid No Bid $172.00 $1,548.00
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 - . .
® | 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte | ° | N°Bid No Bid $2605.00 | $23,445.00
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with . .
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 No Bid No Bid $1,205.00 $10,845.00
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document 9 No Bid No Bid $129.00 $1,161.00
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $1,471.89 $456,285.90 $1,432.00 $443,920.00
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $139.00 $43,090.00 $144.00 $44,640.00
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $499,375.90 $488,560.00
19 |Ricon Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch) 55, | g43941 | 13182300 | $401.00 | $120,300.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

Smart Group Systems
Richardson, TX Brightcentra, Inc.
HUB - Yes South San Francisco, CA
HUB - Yes
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking
1 station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB.C 9 $138.00 $1,242.00 $164.00 $1,476.00
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,220.00 $19,980.00 $2,141.85 $19,276.65
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $210.00 $1,890.00 $217.00 $1,953.00
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $21,870.00 $21,229.65
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer, )
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $195.00 $1,755.00 $203.75 $1,833.75
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte 9 $2,639.00 $23,751.00 $2,676.00 $24,084.00
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,230.00 $11,070.00 $1,250.00 $11,250.00
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 | ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document| o | ¢497 g9 $1,143.00 $130.00 $1,170.00
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $1,471.00 $456,010.00 $1,483.00 $459,730.00
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $152.00 $47,120.00 $161.00 $49,910.00
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $503,130.00 $509,640.00
19 |Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch| 30 | 541500 | $12450000 | $416.00 | $124,800.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

Hypertec USA, Inc.

Staples Contract & Commercial

LLC
Tempe, AZ Framingham, MA
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking . .
! station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB-C 9 No Bid No Bid $194.00 $1,746.00
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 No Bid No Bid $2,328.00 $20,952.00
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 1 |\ gig No Bid $231.00 $2,079.00
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 No Bid $23,031.00
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer, . .
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage o No Bid No Bid $209.00 $1,881.00
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WIiFi Adapte 9 | $2,570.18 $23,131.62 $2,649.00 $23,841.00
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,227.18 $11,044.62 $1,249.00 $11,241.00
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 |ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document| ¢ | g5 56 $1,157.04 $130.00 $1,170.00
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $1,538.85 $477,043.50 $1,515.00 $469,650.00
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $160.60 $49,786.00 $155.00 $48,050.00
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $526,829.50 $517,700.00
19 |Ricon Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch| 454 | s45570 | $136,716.00 | $415.00 | $124,500.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

Argent Associates Inc. Asimer Tech, LLC
Plano, TX Austin, TX
HUB - Yes HUB - No
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking . .
! station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB-C 9 No Bid No Bid $218.19 $1,963.71
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,339.02 $21,051.18 $2,262.42 $20,361.78
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $226.39 $2,037.51 $216.78 $1,951.02
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $23,088.69 $22,312.80
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer,
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $208.97 $1,880.73 $203.53 $1,831.77
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard I[FP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte 9 $4,637.31 $41,735.79 $4,466.22 $40,195.98
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,512.20 $13,609.80 $1,530.45 $13,774.05
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document 9 $146.35 $1.317.15 $142.05 $1,278.45
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $1,809.60 $560,976.00 $1,725.15 $534,796.50
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $314.23 $97,411.30 $298.55 $92,550.50
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $658,387.30 $627,347.00
1o | Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch| 554 |\ gig No Bid $416.66 | $124,998.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

The Repair Depot, LLC

New Tech Solutions, Inc

Stillwater, OK Fremont, CA
HUB - No HUB - No
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking
L station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB-C 9 $200.00 $1.800.00 $146.80 $1.821.20
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,350.00 $21,150.00 $2,223.85 $20,014.65
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $220.00 $1,980.00 $219.87 $1,978.83
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $23,130.00 $21,993.48
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer,
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $217.00 $1,953.00 $208.03 $1.872.27
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte 9 $4,740.00 $42,660.00 $4,210.20 $37,891.80
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,610.00 $14,490.00 $1,470.45 $13,234.05
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document 9 $152.00 $1,368.00 $138.02 $1.242.18
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $1,910.00 $592,100.00 $1,735.88 $538,122.80
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $58.00 $17,980.00 $295.12 $91,487.20
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $610,080.00 $629,610.00
1o |Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch| 54 | s45700 | $140100.00 | $441.32 | $132,396.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

vCloud Tech Inc

Yellow Networks, LLC

Rolling Hills Estate, CA Ames, |IA
HUB - Yes HUB - No
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking
1 station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB.C 9 $292.16 $2,629.44 $388.00 $3,492.00
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,248.35 $20,235.15 $2,298.00 $20,682.00
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $215.29 $1,937.61 $224.00 $2,016.00
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $22,172.76 $22,698.00
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer,
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $204.51 $1,840.59 $213.00 $1,917.00
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard I[FP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte 9 $4,335.65 $39,020.85 $4,445.00 $40,005.00
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,504.81 $13,543.29 $1,545.00 $13,905.00
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document 9 $140.12 $1,261.08 $146.00 $1,314.00
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $1,726.06 $535,078.60 $1,798.00 $557,380.00
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $298.34 $92,485.40 $307.00 $95,170.00
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $627,564.00 $652,550.00
1o |Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch| 5 | ¢43968 | $131,004.00 | $447.00 | $134,100.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

GOOGOZ.COM, INC.
Walnut Creek, CA

M&A Technology, Inc.
Carrollton, TX

HUB - Yes HUB - No
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking . .
1 station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB-C 9 $220.59 $1,685.31 No Bid No Bid
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,274.37 $20,469.33 $2,379.34 $21,414.06
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $219.35 $1,974.15 $231.23 $2,081.07
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $22,443.48 $23,495.13
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer,
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $205.93 $1,853.37 $217.61 $1,958.49
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte 9 $4,589.87 $41,308.83 $2,668.82 $24,019.38
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,531.43 $13,782.87 $1,274.19 $11,467.71
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document 9 $145.67 $1.311.03 $134.41 $1,209.69
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $1,808.65 $560,681.50 $1,857.25 $575,747.50
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $301.95 $93,604.50 $318.39 $98,700.90
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $654,286.00 $674,448.40
19 |Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch| 554 | g44835 | $134,505.00 | $45054 | $135162.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

Aita Technologies
Brunswick, NJ

vPrime Tech Inc

Houston, TX
HUB - Yes HUE - Yes
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking
1 station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB.C 9 $196.29 $1,766.61 $223.98 $2,015.82
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,351.60 $21,164.40 $2,296.75 $20,670.75
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $225.17 $2,026.53 $237.18 $2,134.62
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $23,190.93 $22,805.37
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer,
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $211.28 $1,901.52 $209.34 $1,884.06
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte 9 $4,533.44 $40,800.96 $4,609.88 $41,488.92
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,549.86 $13,948.74 $1,582.18 $14,239.62
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 | ViewSonic Plug'i’;f'n‘g';y USB document| o | ¢448 06 $1,332.54 $150.41 $1,353.69
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $1,805.32 $559,649.20 $1,819.43 $564,023.30
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $312.04 $96,732.40 $303.84 $94,190.40
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $656,381.60 $658,213.70
1 |Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch| 554 | ¢450 15 | 13564500 | $451.07 | $135,321.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

Tech Advanced Computers Projectized Solutions, LLC
Pensacola, FL San Antonio, TX
HUB - Yes HUB - Yes
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking
1 station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB.C 9 $312.00 $2,808.00 $250.65 $2,255.85
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,260.00 $20,340.00 $2,284.22 $20,557.98
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $221.00 $1,989.00 $235.00 $2,115.00
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $22,329.00 $22,672.98
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer,
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $209.00 $1,881.00 $220.00 $1,980.00
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte 9 $2,960.00 $26,640.00 $4,458.47 $40,126.23
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,300.00 $11,700.00 $1,527.79 $13,750.11
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 |ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document| o | ¢4, 59 $1,179.00 $141.81 $1,276.29
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $1,920.00 $595,200.00 $1,845.49 $572,101.90
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $302.00 $93,620.00 $310.00 $96,100.00
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $688,820.00 $668,201.90
19 |Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch| 455 | g43000 | $129,000.00 | $457.00 $137,100.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

Aztek Computers CAN-AM Wireless LLC
Carroliton, TX Cedar Park, TX
HUB - No HUB - Yes
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking
1 station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB.C 9 $390.00 $3,510.00 $150.35 $1,353.15
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 | $2,105.00 $18,945.00 $2,345.98 $21,113.82
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $218.00 $1,962.00 $222.27 $2,000.43
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $20,907.00 $23,114.25
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer,
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $210.00 $1,890.00 $210.50 $1,894.50
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte 9 $4,580.00 $41,220.00 $4,566.49 $41,098.41
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,545.00 $13,905.00 $1,564.81 $14,083.29
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 |ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document| o | ¢4,5 49 $1,305.00 $145.24 $1,307.16
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $1,925.00 $596,750.00 $1,953.29 $605,519.90
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $307.00 $95,170.00 $306.10 $94,891.00
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $691,920.00 $700,410.90
1o |Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch| 45, | 45000 | $135,00000 | $451.11 | $135,333.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

Argus IT Services 3-C TECHNOLOGY, LLC
Fort Worth, TX Lancaster, TX
HUB - No HUB - Yes
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking
1 station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB.C 9 $161.10 $1,449.90 $459.24 $4,133.16
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,508.61 $22,577.49 $2,432.25 $21,890.25
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $239.50 $2,155.50 $249.55 $2,245.95
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $24,732.99 $24,136.20
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer,
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $228.40 $2,055.60 $220.59 $1,985.31
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte 9 $5,041.78 $45,376.02 $5,017.36 $45,156.24
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,730.42 $15,573.78 $1,663.51 $14,971.59
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 | ViewSonic P'ug'acgg;z';y USB document) ¢ | ¢164 50 $1,480.50 $158.15 $1,423.35
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $1,987.13 $616,010.30 $2,038.37 $631,894.70
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $331.84 $102,870.40 $328.62 $101,872.20
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $718,880.70 $733,766.90
19 |Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch| 55, | g405 65 | g14779500 | $472.32 | $141.696.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

Southern Computer SHI International
Warehouse .
. Austin, TX
Marietta, GA HUR - Yes
HUB - Yes
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking . .
1 station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB-C 9 No Bid No Bid $200.19 $1.801.71
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,346.89 $21,122.01 $2,387.80 $21,490.20
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $254.01 $2,286.09 $225.18 $2,026.62
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $23,408.10 $23,5616.82
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer,
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $210.68 $1,896.12 $215.59 $1,940.31
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard |FP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte 9 $4.668.46 $42,016.14 $2,882.15 $25,939.35
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,574.49 $14,170.41 $1,335.79 $12,022.11
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document 9 $146.14 $1.315.26 $135.02 $1,215.18
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $2,158.47 $669,125.70 $2,216.72 $687,183.20
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $335.04 $103,862.40 $315.98 $97,953.80
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $772,988.10 $785,137.00
19 |Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap iX2500 Touch | 454 | g4o834 | 12850200 | $46524 | $139572.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No.

F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

Toca, LLC T.ANLOGISTICS LLC
Keller, TX Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
Line # Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking
1 station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB.C 9 $600.00 $5,400.00 $257.98 $2,321.82
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,492.03 $22,428.27 $2,790.10 $25,110.90
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - 9 | $350.00 $3,150.00 $279.99 $2,519.91
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $25,578.27 $27,630.81
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer,
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $335.00 $3,015.00 $294.45 $2,650.05
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte 9 $4,900.00 $44,100.00 $6,056.99 $54,512.91
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,650.00 $14,850.00 $1.801.12 $16,210.08
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 |ViewSonic Plug'ig‘:;z:;y USB document| o | 76500 $2,385.00 $183.99 $1,655.91
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $2,121.81 $657,761.10 $2,000.95 $620,294.50
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $357.38 $110,787.80 $450.99 $139,806.90
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $768,548.90 $760,101.40
1o |Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap IX2500 Touch| 454 | ¢50000 | $150,00000 | $511.99 | $153,597.00
Screen Scanner




Bid No. F2025202 Purchase of Technology Refresh Project

E-LOGIC, INC. Princetin IT Services
Washingotn, DC Princeton, NJ
HUB - No HUB - Yes
Line # |Description QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended
Microsoft Surface Dock 2 - docking
1 station - Surface Connect - 2 x USB.C 9 $315.40 $2,838.60 $192.62 $1,733.58
Microsoft Surface Pro 10 5G - 13" - 32
2 GB RAM - 512 GB SSD - Windows 11 9 $2,235.78 $20,122.02 $2,304.82 $20,743.38
Pro
3 Microsoft Complete for Business - o | $233.41 $2,100.69 $220.93 $1,988.37
extended service agreement - 4 years
Total Price for Lines 2 & 3 $22,222.71 $22,731.75
Microsoft Surface Pro Keyboard -
Keyboard - with accelerometer,
4 trackpad, Surface Slim Pen 2 Storage 9 $220.78 $1,987.02 $207.34 $1,866.06
and Charging Tray
ViewSonic ViewBoard IFP8652-1C-E4 -
5 4K Interactive Display with WiFi Adapte 9 $4,939.87 $44,458.83 $4,549.46 $40,945.14
ViewSonic TRS10-UB Bundle for
Microsoft Teams Rooms with
6 Conferencing Camera, Compute Engine 9 $1,680.42 $15,123.78 $1,558.97 $14,030.73
Mini PC and Touch Console
7 |ViewSonic Plug-and-play USB document) o | 4,54 g9 $1,384.20 $144.70 $1,302.30
camera
HP Elite x360 830 G11 13.3"
8 Touchscreen Convertible 2 in 1 310 | $2,214.77 $686,578.70 $1,883.15 $583,776.50
Notebook - WUXGA
HP Care Pack Premium Onsite Support -
9 4 Year - Warranty 310 $323.54 $100,297.40 $304.15 $94,286.50
Total for Lines 8 & 9 $786,876.10 $678,063.00
1o |Ricoh Scanner ScanSnap IX2500 Touch| 450 | ¢455 88 | $144.864.00 | $445.95 | $133.785.00
Screen Scanner

Notes: No-bids were received from Network Craze Technologies, Inc, Richmond Equipment, Synergy Telecom, Inc.,
Dahili Office Technology Corporation, Silicon Mountain Memory, CSI Leasing, Inc., Communication Concepts, 4 Tech Soluti

Texas Pipeline Services.
Items 2 & 3 and items 8 & 9 have been awarded as combined totals to ensure the same vendor supplies both hardware

and warranty for continuity of support.



Community Supervision and Corrections Department
200 W Belknap, Fort Worth, TX 76196-0255
817-884-1600

Cobi Title, Director Kanika Lee, Assistant Director

Steven Powell, Assistant Director

7/29/2025

Kehinde Olugbile

Senior Buyer

100 E. Weatherford Street, Suite 303
Fort Worth, Texas 76196

Re: F2025202 - Purchase of Technology Refresh Project
Dear Ms. Olugbile:

After evaluation of the information provided in the responses, Tarrant County Community Supervision and
Corrections Department recommends award of Bid F2025202 to the following vendors:

Primary Brightcentra, Inc. 1 0f 10 items
Aztek Computers 2 of 10 items

Smart Group Systems 1 0f 10 items

CDW Government LLC 5 of 10 items

Hypertech USA Inc. 1 of 10 items

Secondary Staples Contract & Commercial LLC 1 of 10 items
. Government Goods, Inc. 2 of 10 items

Smart Group Systems 4 of 10 items

Hypertech USA Inc. 2 of 10 items

Adorama Inc. 1 of 10 items

Sincerely,
S @ ne

Steven Powell
Assistant Director
Tarrant County CSCD




RERE TAKINGS IMPACT ASSESSMENT CHECKLIST

Complete this form for any county action that involves the adoption of a regulation,
policy, guideline, court resolution, or order.

Project/Regulation Name:__Bid No. F2025202 - Purchase of Technology Refresh Project -
Community Supervision and Corrections Department - Various Vendors - Per Unit Price

County Department: PURCHASING

Contact Person: Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.

Phone Number for Contact Person: (817) 884-3245

Type of TIA Performed: (SHORT TIA or FULL TIA. Circle one after answering the questions in
Sections Il and Il below.

Fdedekdkdddkkkhidkhdkkihddhkdkhikkkikikdokdkkkddkdkddkkddkkdkihkiikkdikkkikhkkhkkdhhkiohkikhkhkhhikkkdhhidhdkkkikkkkkikikk

I Stated Purpose

Attach to this checklist an explanation of the purpose of the regulation, policy, guideline,
court resolution, or order.

Fedededokdedodededodeokkodeokodekdekkokodokkodedekokokkkokkkodok kdokdedok dedododekdodedoded dode dededeododededodedededodededeokodededodedededekeodedodekedededede kedeodededededeok dedek dedededededeok dededke dekeok

Note: The remainder of this Takings Impact Assessment Checklist should
be completed in consultation with the Criminal District Attorney’s Office.

L. Potential Effect on Private Real Property

1. Does the county action require a physical invasion, occupation, or dedication of real
property?

Yes No v

2. Does the county action limit or restrict a real property right, even partially, or
temporarily?

Yes No N

If you answered yes to either question, go to Section Ill. If you answered no to both, STOP
HERE and circle SHORT TIA at the top of the form.

Fedede dedededok dededodededode ko ok ek dedeke dedede dededededek dokede dededede ek dodkokode kodedededededeodedkekode ko dededeok dodedeok ke dedeodkeode dek dedkedededeodeode dedode dededededededeokoko kedede ok dedekokedokdokedeokkeok



